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True or False?

Most PowerPoint presentations are:

?compelling
?illuminating
?informative
?clear and to the point
Answer: False

Make a change following the principles of Stephen Kosslyn:

?a world authority on the visual brain
?a clear and engaging writer
Making PowerPoint presentations that are clear, compelling, memorable, and even enjoyable is not an
obscure art. In this book, Stephen Kosslyn, a renowned cognitive neuroscientist, presents eight simple
principles for constructing a presentation that takes advantage of the information modern science has
discovered about perception, memory, and cognition. Using hundreds of images and sample slides, he shows
the common mistakes many people make and the simple ways to fix them. For example, never use
underlining to emphasize a word--the line will cut off the bottom of letters that have descending lines (such
as p and g), which interferes with the brain's ability to recognize text. Other tips include why you should
state your conclusion at the beginning of a presentation, when to use a line graph versus a bar graph, and
how to use color correctly. By following Kosslyn's principles, anyone will be able to produce a presentation
that works!
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From reader reviews:

Nellie Ferguson:

Many people spending their period by playing outside using friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by reading a book. Ugh,
do you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It alright
you can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Clear and to the Point: 8
Psychological Principles for Compelling PowerPoint Presentations which is getting the e-book version. So ,
why not try out this book? Let's view.

Cari Sexton:

You may get this Clear and to the Point: 8 Psychological Principles for Compelling PowerPoint
Presentations by look at the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve
problem if you get difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only simply by
written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book simply by e-book. In the modern era such as now,
you just looking from your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your own
ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your
knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose appropriate ways for you.

Gloria Lockwood:

Book is one of source of know-how. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but native or
citizen need book to know the up-date information of year to help year. As we know those guides have many
advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world. With the book
Clear and to the Point: 8 Psychological Principles for Compelling PowerPoint Presentations we can have
more advantage. Don't that you be creative people? To be creative person must like to read a book. Only
choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life with this book Clear
and to the Point: 8 Psychological Principles for Compelling PowerPoint Presentations. You can more
desirable than now.

Richard Forbes:

A number of people said that they feel weary when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt it when they
get a half regions of the book. You can choose the book Clear and to the Point: 8 Psychological Principles
for Compelling PowerPoint Presentations to make your personal reading is interesting. Your personal skill of
reading proficiency is developing when you just like reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make
you enjoy to study it and mingle the feeling about book and studying especially. It is to be initial opinion for
you to like to wide open a book and read it. Beside that the book Clear and to the Point: 8 Psychological
Principles for Compelling PowerPoint Presentations can to be your new friend when you're feel alone and
confuse using what must you're doing of this time.
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