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The clock activates so suddenly in my mind, my head involuntarily jerks a bit to the side. The fog vanishes,
dissipated in an instant as though it never was. Memories come slotting into place, their edges sharp enough
to leave furrows, and suddenly I know. I know exactly who I am.

My name is Lia Johansen, and I was named for a prisoner of war. She lived in the Tiersten Internment
Colony for two years, and when they negotiated the return of the prisoners, I was given her memories and
sent back in her place.

And I am a genetically engineered human bomb.

Lia Johansen was created for only one purpose: to slip onto the strategically placed New Sol Space Station
and explode. But her mission goes to hell when her clock malfunctions, freezing her countdown with just
two minutes to go. With no Plan B, no memories of her past, and no identity besides a name stolen from a
dead POW, Lia has no idea what to do next. Her life gets even more complicated when she meets Michael
Sorenson, the real Lia’s childhood best friend.

Drawn to Michael and his family against her better judgment, Lia starts learning what it means to live and
love, and to be human. It is only when her countdown clock begins sporadically losing time that she realizes
even duds can still blow up. If she wants any chance at a future, she must find a way to unlock the secrets of
her past and stop her clock. But as Lia digs into her origins, she begins to suspect there’s far more to her
mission and to this war, than meets the eye. With the fate of not just a space station but an entire empire
hanging in the balance, Lia races to find the truth before her time—literally—runs out.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Christine McClellan:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing for
us to find out everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that e-
book has different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They are really
reading whatever they have because their hobby is actually reading a book. Think about the person who don't
like studying a book? Sometime, man feel need book after they found difficult problem or perhaps exercise.
Well, probably you'll have this Nova: Book One of Nova.

William Lee:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them loved
ones or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, as
well as playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity this is look different you
can read some sort of book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent the
whole day to reading a guide. The book Nova: Book One of Nova it is quite good to read. There are a lot of
people that recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not
have enough space to bring this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this
book from a smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book possesses high quality.

David Gonzales:

Is it anyone who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by means of watching television
programs or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something new? This Nova: Book One of Nova can be
the reply, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your extra time by
reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these guides have than the others?

Nancy Bowers:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from your book. Book is composed or printed or outlined from each source that will filled
update of news. In this particular modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available
for an individual. From media social including newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia,
reference book, novel and comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your
spare time to spread out your book? Or just seeking the Nova: Book One of Nova when you essential it?
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