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Women in ancient Rome challenge the historian. Widely represented in literature and art, they rarely speak
for themselves. Amy Richlin, among the foremost pioneers in ancient studies, gives voice to these women
through scholarship that scours sources from high art to gutter invective.

In Arguments with Silence, Richlin presents a linked selection of her essays on Roman women’s history,
originally published between 1981 and 2001 as the field of “women in antiquity” took shape, and here
substantially rewritten and updated. The new introduction to the volume lays out the historical
methodologies these essays developed, places this process in its own historical setting, and reviews work on
Roman women since 2001, along with persistent silences. Individual chapter introductions locate each piece
in the social context of Second Wave feminism in Classics and the academy, explaining why each mattered
as an intervention then and still does now.

Inhabiting these pages are the women whose lives were shaped by great art, dirty jokes, slavery, and the
definition of adultery as a wife’s crime; Julia, Augustus’ daughter, who died, as her daughter would, exiled
to a desert island; women wearing makeup, safeguarding babies with amulets, practicing their religion at
home and in public ceremonies; the satirist Sulpicia, flaunting her sexuality; and the praefica, leading the
lament for the dead.

Amy Richlin is one of a small handful of modern thinkers in a position to consider these questions, and this
guided journey with her brings surprise, delight, and entertainment, as well as a fresh look at important
questions.
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From reader reviews:

Jose York:

Book is written, printed, or created for everything. You can learn everything you want by a reserve. Book
has a different type. We all know that that book is important thing to bring us around the world. Close to that
you can your reading talent was fluently. A reserve Arguments with Silence: Writing the History of Roman
Women will make you to become smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about
anything. But some of you think that open or reading the book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why
they can be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or suited book with you?

Karen Shiner:

Does one one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Make an effort to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't assess book by its deal with
may doesn't work the following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since
fantastic as in the outside appear likes. Maybe you answer might be Arguments with Silence: Writing the
History of Roman Women why because the fantastic cover that make you consider in regards to the content
will not disappoint an individual. The inside or content is usually fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your
reading sixth sense will directly make suggestions to pick up this book.

Ronald Johnson:

The book untitled Arguments with Silence: Writing the History of Roman Women contain a lot of
information on the idea. The writer explains your ex idea with easy approach. The language is very clear to
see all the people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was written by famous author.
The author will take you in the new era of literary works. You can read this book because you can keep
reading your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. In a situation you
wish to purchase the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice go
through.

Andrea Quirk:

A lot of e-book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by world wide web on social
media. You can choose the most beneficial book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by searching
from it. It is referred to as of book Arguments with Silence: Writing the History of Roman Women. You can
add your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make you
happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about guide. It can bring you from one location to
other place.
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