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This lively, moving narrative provides the first comprehensive account of the emigration of nearly 500,000
Soviet Jews to the United States between 1967 and 1997. By weaving a wide variety of immigrant voices
and photographs together with historical, journalistic, social service, and psychological studies of Soviet
Jewish immigration, this book offers a comprehensive and highly readable introduction to the history,
politics, and culture of this important new American population. Topics covered include the varied reasons
for their exodus from the Soviet Union, what they found in the United States, the communities they created
there, and the cultural problems they encountered. The author, an expert on this group, dispels stereotypical
notions about Soviet Jewish immigrants by exploring the tremendous social, political, and cultural diversity
of the nearly half million Soviet Jews now living in the United States.

Making abundant use of interviews and photographs, this book is as accessible as it is informative. It opens
with a history of Jewish life in the Soviet Union as remembered by elderly immigrants. Theirs are gripping
memoirs of the turbulence of revolutionary Russia, the horror of Nazi occupation, Josef Stalin's post-war
assault on surviving Jewish leaders, and the emergence from the ashes of a flourishing Jewish counterculture
in the 1960s and 1970s. Immigrant voices narrate the history of this Jewish exodus, which began as a protest
movement by a handful of courageous activists and developed into a mass migration. The second half of the
book vividly evokes life in Soviet Jewish communities across the United States, from the crowded urban
landscape of Brighton Beach, Brooklyn, to the palmy, smoggy enclave of West Hollywood, California.
Class, gender, and cultural and political divisions are all addressed in this fascinating portrait of a complex
and diverse community.
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Fleischmann:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to learn everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or goal; it means that reserve has different
type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They are really reading
whatever they have because their hobby is usually reading a book. What about the person who don't like
reading a book? Sometime, person feel need book once they found difficult problem or exercise. Well,
probably you will want this The Soviet Jewish Americans (The New Americans).

Larry Parrish:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the name The Soviet Jewish
Americans (The New Americans) suitable to you? The book was written by renowned writer in this era.
Typically the book untitled The Soviet Jewish Americans (The New Americans)is the main of several books
which everyone read now. This particular book was inspired many men and women in the world. When you
read this guide you will enter the new dimensions that you ever know before. The author explained their
strategy in the simple way, so all of people can easily to recognise the core of this guide. This book will give
you a lots of information about this world now. In order to see the represented of the world on this book.

Alan Durham:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book especially book entitled The
Soviet Jewish Americans (The New Americans) your mind will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in every single aspect that maybe unknown for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging
just about every word written in a guide then become one form conclusion and explanation this maybe you
never get ahead of. The The Soviet Jewish Americans (The New Americans) giving you yet another
experience more than blown away your brain but also giving you useful data for your better life on this era.
So now let us explain to you the relaxing pattern this is your body and mind will be pleased when you are
finished examining it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling out spare
time activity?

Jack Bell:

Beside this particular The Soviet Jewish Americans (The New Americans) in your phone, it could give you a
way to get closer to the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you can got here is
fresh through the oven so don't end up being worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow
community. It is good thing to have The Soviet Jewish Americans (The New Americans) because this book
offers to your account readable information. Do you occasionally have book but you seldom get what it's
interesting features of. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable blend here
cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss that? Find this book in
addition to read it from currently!
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