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These early works by Robert E. Howard were originally published in the early 20th century and we are now
republishing them with a brand new introductory biography. 'Three Tales of Solomon Kane' is a compilation
of Howard's short stories in the Solomon Kane series and include 'Skulls in the Stars', 'Rattle of Bones', and
'Red Shadows'. Robert Ervin Howard was born in Peaster, Texas in 1906. During his youth, his family
moved between a variety of Texan boomtowns, and Howard – a bookish and somewhat introverted child –
was steeped in the violent myths and legends of the Old South. At fifteen Howard began to read the pulp
magazines of the day, and to write more seriously. The December 1922 issue of his high school newspaper
featured two of his stories, 'Golden Hope Christmas' and 'West is West'. In 1924 he sold his first piece – a
short caveman tale titled 'Spear and Fang' – for $16 to the not-yet-famous Weird Tales magazine. Howard's
most famous character, Conan the Cimmerian, was a barbarian-turned-King during the Hyborian Age, a
mythical period of some 12,000 years ago. Conan featured in seventeen Weird Tales stories between 1933
and 1936 which is why Howard is now regarded as having spawned the 'sword and sorcery' genre. The
Conan stories have since been adapted many times, most famously in the series of films starring Arnold
Schwarzenegger.
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From reader reviews:

Leah Pelton:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or their very own friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, going to beach, or
picnic from the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to
fill your current free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book may be option to fill your totally free
time/ holiday. The first thing you ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to attempt
look for book, may be the publication untitled Three Tales of Solomon Kane (A Collection of Short Stories)
can be good book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Daryl Thurmond:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book
store? Try to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't evaluate book by its handle may
doesn't work this is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the
outside appearance likes. Maybe you answer can be Three Tales of Solomon Kane (A Collection of Short
Stories) why because the amazing cover that make you consider in regards to the content will not disappoint
a person. The inside or content is actually fantastic as the outside or cover. Your reading 6th sense will
directly direct you to pick up this book.

Gale Coachman:

Reading a book for being new life style in this season; every people loves to go through a book. When you
read a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge,
because book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you want to get information about your study, you can read education books, but if you
want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, as well as soon. The
Three Tales of Solomon Kane (A Collection of Short Stories) provide you with a new experience in reading
a book.

Raymond Augustus:

Beside this kind of Three Tales of Solomon Kane (A Collection of Short Stories) in your phone, it could give
you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you might got
here is fresh through the oven so don't end up being worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow
village. It is good thing to have Three Tales of Solomon Kane (A Collection of Short Stories) because this
book offers to you readable information. Do you often have book but you seldom get what it's facts
concerning. Oh come on, that wil happen if you have this inside your hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot
be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss the item? Find this book as
well as read it from today!
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