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A wickedly funny look at opera today--the feuds and deals, maestros and managers, divine voices and
outsized egos--and a portrait of the opera world's newest superstar at a formative point in her life and career.
        In Cinderella & Company, Pulitzer Prize-winning journalist Manuela Hoelterhoff takes us on a two-
year trip on the circuit with Cecilia Bartoli, the young mezzo-soprano who has captured an adoring public
around the world.
        Rossini's Cenerentola is Bartoli's signature role, and Cinderella & Company tells the fairy-tale story of
her life, which started on a modest street in Rome where the Fiat was the coach of choice. The lucky break,
the meteoric rise, the starlit nights and nail-chewing days are all part of a narrative that shows Bartoli
rehearsing, playing, traveling, eating, and charming us with her vivacity and dazzling virtuosity.  
        Along the way, Hoelterhoff gives us an unusually vivid, behind-the-scenes look at the opera world. The
first stop is Houston, where Bartoli brightens a droopy Cenerentola production; later scenes follow her to
Disney World and to the Metropolitan Opera, where a fidgety cast awaits the flight-phobic mezzo's arrival
for Mozart's Cosi fan tutte. Traveling to Santa Fe, Paris, Rome, Venice, and London, Hoelterhoff drops in
on opening nights and boardroom meetings, talks to managers and agents, describes where the money comes
from, and survives one of the longest galas in history.  
        Here too are tantalizing glimpses of divinities large and small: Kathleen Battle's famously chilly
limousine ride; Plácido Domingo flying through three time zones to step into the boots of an ailing Otello;
Luciano Pavarotti aiming for high C in his twilight years. And we meet the present players in Bartoli's world:
Roberto Alagna and Angela Gheorghiu, a.k.a. the Love Couple; Jane Eaglen, the Wagnerian web potato
monitoring her cyberspace fan mail; the appealing soprano Renée Fleming, finally on the brink of stardom.  
        At once informed and accessible, Cinderella & Company brings the world of grand opera into sharp
focus--right up to the last glimpse of Cecilia Bartoli waving triumphantly from Cinderella's wedding cake.

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Milford Garrett:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. As
we know that book is very important for people. The book Cinderella and Company: Backstage at the Opera
with Cecilia Bartoli seemed to be making you to know about other information and of course you can take
more information. It is extremely advantages for you. The book Cinderella and Company: Backstage at the
Opera with Cecilia Bartoli is not only giving you more new information but also to be your friend when you
really feel bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship
with the book Cinderella and Company: Backstage at the Opera with Cecilia Bartoli. You never really feel
lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Stephen Hilton:

The e-book untitled Cinderella and Company: Backstage at the Opera with Cecilia Bartoli is the publication
that recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown
to you actually. The language that writer use to explained their way of doing something is easily to
understand. The author was did a lot of study when write the book, therefore the information that they share
for you is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of Cinderella and Company: Backstage at the
Opera with Cecilia Bartoli from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.

James Gardner:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you can have it in e-
book technique, more simple and reachable. This Cinderella and Company: Backstage at the Opera with
Cecilia Bartoli can give you a lot of good friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have
factor that they don't and make you more like an interesting person. This book can be one of one step for you
to get success. This book offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more
than other make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? Let's have Cinderella and Company: Backstage at
the Opera with Cecilia Bartoli.

Darren Reid:

A lot of publication has printed but it is unique. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the best book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is called of
book Cinderella and Company: Backstage at the Opera with Cecilia Bartoli. You'll be able to your
knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make you actually
happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one
destination for a other place.
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