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The dictionary provides explanations of the meaning and origins of generic and specific names of grasses,
one of the largest and economically most important plant families. There are about 12,500 entries, which far
exceed in number those of any other dictionary in print. Most of the names published during the past 250
years are included. Throughout the family, the gross morphologies of plants conform to a relatively fixed
pattern, thereby restricting the number of descriptive terms available from which to form generic or specific
names. Accordingly, many taxa and especially species have names based on usage, locality or collector.
Because it is usually easier to remember a technical name once its meaning is known, this work should be of
value to a wide audience, including ecologists, agronomists, and anthropologists. Others interested in the
history of taxonomy, but not necessarily that of grasses, will find the dictionary a useful resource.
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From reader reviews:

Jeremy Richards:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a e-book you will get new information since book is one of several ways to share the
information or maybe their idea. Second, looking at a book will make you actually more imaginative. When
you looking at a book especially fictional works book the author will bring someone to imagine the story
how the characters do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other folks. When you read this
Etymological Dictionary of Grasses, you are able to tells your family, friends and also soon about yours
publication. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a publication.

Janet Thaxton:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with pals is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try matter that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you are ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Etymological Dictionary of Grasses,
you are able to enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of hangout
type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout men. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its named reading
friends.

Daniel Watkins:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to decide on book
like comic, small story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not attempting Etymological Dictionary of
Grasses that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading practice
all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world considerably better then how they
react to the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky man but for all of
you who wants to always be success person. So , for all of you who want to start looking at as your good
habit, you can pick Etymological Dictionary of Grasses become your starter.

Karen Johnson:

With this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability in doing something more are more
special than other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you need
to do is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of many
books in the top listing in your reading list is usually Etymological Dictionary of Grasses. This book which is
qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking right up and
review this reserve you can get many advantages.
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