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Featuring an insightful look at lesbian, gay, bisexual, and transgender (LGBT) life in Cuba, this chronicle
illuminates the progress the country has made from centuries of backward attitudes and oppression to the
current state of enlightenment. From the mores of the Colonial period to the roles that Hollywood, the CIA,
and Wall Street played in depicting Cuba as a “police state” for gays and in reinforcing the oppression, this
overview provides a backdrop of the past and illustrates the persecution and exploitation originally planted
by Spanish colonialism and further cultivated by U.S. capitalism. Details on the gradual transformation
follow as the narrative examines the impact of the political and institutional initiatives taken by Fidel Castro
and the Cuban leadership to overcome bigotry and prejudice against LGBT people—among them free health
care and education, guaranteed jobs and housing, special health care for AIDS victims, and widespread sex
education.
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From reader reviews:

Curtis Monahan:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a reserve you will get new information due to the fact book is one of many ways
to share the information or maybe their idea. Second, reading a book will make an individual more
imaginative. When you examining a book especially fiction book the author will bring one to imagine the
story how the figures do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other people. When you read
this Rainbow Solidarity in Defense of Cuba, you can tells your family, friends in addition to soon about
yours book. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a guide.

Mary Killgore:

Precisely why? Because this Rainbow Solidarity in Defense of Cuba is an unordinary book that the inside of
the guide waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will distress you with the secret the idea inside.
Reading this book alongside it was fantastic author who else write the book in such amazing way makes the
content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is
good for you because of not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This amazing book
will give you a lot of benefits than the other book include such as help improving your ability and your
critical thinking approach. So , still want to delay having that book? If I have been you I will go to the e-
book store hurriedly.

Louis Trent:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you may have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try thing that really opposite
from that. One activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Rainbow Solidarity in Defense of
Cuba, you could enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of hangout
type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its referred to as
reading friends.

Sandra Romero:

Many people spending their time by playing outside using friends, fun activity together with family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by reading a book. Ugh,
think reading a book will surely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It all right you can have
the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Rainbow Solidarity in Defense of
Cuba which is keeping the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's see.
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