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Originally published in 1900, this book features excerpts from Alexander Cavalié Mercer's account of the
battle of Waterloo. As an artillery officer at the sharp end, this is his eye-witness account of the events that
lead to Napoleon's final defeat in June 1815. This is the contemporary view of how the events were
conveyed to the public of Great Britain. Featuring original engravings from the Illustrated London News and
the Graphic, and many paintings from the era, this book was written during the height of the British Empire,
and the triumphalist mood of the day is reflected in the tone of the text. This detailed military history
provides an echo of the contemporary attitudes to this turbulent time which shaped the destiny of the British
Empire. This book is part of the 'Military History From Primary Sources' series, a new military history range
compiled and edited by Emmy Award winning author and historian Bob Carruthers. The series draws on
primary sources and contemporary documents to provide a new insight into the true nature of warfare. The
series consultant is David Mcwhinnie, creator of the award winning PBS series 'Battlefield'.
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From reader reviews:

Cicely Silber:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book especially book
entitled Waterloo 1815: Captain Mercers Journal (Military History from Primary Sources) your thoughts will
drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely will end
up your mind friends. Imaging each and every word written in a guide then become one form conclusion and
explanation in which maybe you never get ahead of. The Waterloo 1815: Captain Mercers Journal (Military
History from Primary Sources) giving you another experience more than blown away your head but also
giving you useful information for your better life with this era. So now let us present to you the relaxing
pattern is your body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning a
sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Willie Quinones:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our expertise for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we wish. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year has
been exactly added. This e-book Waterloo 1815: Captain Mercers Journal (Military History from Primary
Sources) was filled concerning science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your scientific
research competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how
big benefit from a book, you can feel enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like right now, many ways to
get book that you just wanted.

Annette Dixon:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This particular book Waterloo 1815: Captain Mercers Journal
(Military History from Primary Sources) was bright colored and of course has pictures on the website. As we
know that book Waterloo 1815: Captain Mercers Journal (Military History from Primary Sources) has many
kinds or genre. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and
believe that you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book usually are make you bored, any it
can make you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading in
which.

Cinthia Jacobsen:

Publication is one of source of know-how. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen need book to know the change information of year to help year. As we know those publications
have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world. With
the book Waterloo 1815: Captain Mercers Journal (Military History from Primary Sources) we can acquire
more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? To be creative person must love to read a book. Simply
choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your life by this book



Waterloo 1815: Captain Mercers Journal (Military History from Primary Sources). You can more desirable
than now.
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