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Este curso desarrolla los procesos de edición de fotografías digitales con Photoshop de forma clara y simple
para lograr un tratamiento fotográfico profesional.
Al finalizar el curso, el alumno/a dominará diferentes técnicas de trabajo dirigidas a la edición básica y a la
obtención de diferentes efectos especiales y fotocomposiciones. Está dirigido a todos los aficionados a la
fotografía que quieran iniciarse en la edición de fotografías digitales y la obtención de diferentes efectos. El
curso se desdobla en dos líneas de formación de modo que pueda seguirse con versiones diferentes del
programa. La línea basada en Photoshop CS6 se puede seguir también con versiones posteriores, pero no con
las anteriores CS2, CS3, CS4 y CS5. Los contenidos son: 1. Crear desde la nada. 2. Flujo de trabajo con
fotografías digitales. 3. Retoques fotográficos. 4. Efectos creativos. 5. Retoques de personas y glamour. 6.
Composición, fotomontaje y presentación de fotografías. 7. CS6. 8. Flujo de trabajo en Camera Raw.
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From reader reviews:

Debra Richardson:

This book untitled Photoshop básico CS6 (Spanish Edition) to be one of several books in which best seller in
this year, honestly, that is because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will
easily to buy this particular book in the book shop or you can order it via online. The publisher of this book
sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, because you can read this book in your
Smartphone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this guide from your list.

Mary Marshall:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them loved ones or
their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or even
playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity that is look different you can read
a book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent 24 hours a day to
reading a reserve. The book Photoshop básico CS6 (Spanish Edition) it is rather good to read. There are a lot
of those who recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have
enough space to bring this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book
out of your smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book possesses high quality.

Allen Goehring:

Photoshop básico CS6 (Spanish Edition) can be one of your starter books that are good idea. We all
recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in
language, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The writer giving his/her effort
to set every word into delight arrangement in writing Photoshop básico CS6 (Spanish Edition) but doesn't
forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource information that maybe
you can be certainly one of it. This great information may drawn you into fresh stage of crucial
contemplating.

Elizabeth Easterling:

Reading a book being new life style in this year; every people loves to go through a book. When you go
through a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
due to the fact book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of
book that you have read. If you want to get information about your research, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these us novel, comics, in addition
to soon. The Photoshop básico CS6 (Spanish Edition) offer you a new experience in reading through a book.
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