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The Chalk Group of southern and eastern England preserves a rich marine fauna of Late Cretaceous age. In
this work, first published in seven parts between 1902 and 1912, Arthur Smith Woodward (1864-1944)
provides what remains the principal account of fossil fishes from these deposits. Woodward describes and
illustrates over fifty genera of ray-finned, lobe-finned, and cartilaginous fishes. The three-dimensional
preservation of some Chalk fishes allows Woodward to describe aspects of anatomy not visible in heavily
compressed fossils of similar age from other localities. Woodward finds that the fine detail apparent in bony
fish skulls from the Chalk provides evidence of a closer correspondence between Cretaceous species and
their modern relatives than had previously been anticipated. This monograph represents one of Woodward's
last truly monumental contributions on fossil fishes, and was completed at around the time his scientific
attention became increasingly dedicated to the now infamous Piltdown Man.
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From reader reviews:

Roland Hall:

What do you think of book? It is just for students because they're still students or this for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has
several personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they don't desire
do that. You must know how great as well as important the book The Fossil Fishes of the English Chalk
(Cambridge Library Collection - Monographs of the Palaeontographical Society). All type of book could you
see on many methods. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Vicki Harris:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information today can get by anyone in everywhere. The
information can be a knowledge or any news even a concern. What people must be consider whenever those
information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now is taking seriously which one would
work to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable resource then
you get it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will not
happen throughout you if you take The Fossil Fishes of the English Chalk (Cambridge Library Collection -
Monographs of the Palaeontographical Society) as your daily resource information.

Shawn Young:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with buddies is thing that usually
you could have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try factor that really opposite from
that. One particular activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you are ride on and with addition details. Even you love The Fossil Fishes of the English Chalk (Cambridge
Library Collection - Monographs of the Palaeontographical Society), you can enjoy both. It is excellent
combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh seriously its mind hangout
guys. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Andre Barrett:

You may get this The Fossil Fishes of the English Chalk (Cambridge Library Collection - Monographs of the
Palaeontographical Society) by go to the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it might to be your
solve problem if you get difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this book are various. Not only by means
of written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era similar
to now, you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your
personal ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately
make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.
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