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EARTH STANDS ALONE

The Coalition of Planets has shattered, with Vulcan, Andor, and Tellar abrogating the treaty. Their pledge to
come to the mutual defense of any power that is attacked has been shunted aside. Horrified by how easily the
Romulans can seize control of their advanced starships, turning them into weapons, Andor and Tellar have
joined Vulcan on the sidelines. Humanity is now the only thing that stands between the Romulan Star
Empire and total domination of the galaxy.

To drive humans from the stars, the Romulans employ ruthless and murderous tactics . . . and even dare to
strike on the Vulcan homeworld with the hopes of demoralizing their Vulcan brethren. Heartened by their
victories, the Romulans carry their all-out war assault closer to the heart of humanity—Earth.

But the tattered remains of Starfleet stand unwavering, with the resolution that never again would any enemy
strike ever reach Earth. On the front lines of the Earth- Romulan War is the United Earth flagship, the
Starship Enterprise. Her captain, Jonathan Archer, has seen his vessel of exploration become a battleship.
Once hailed for his work bringing the Coalition of Planets into existence, Archer is now a pariah. Undaunted,
the captain keeps fighting, searching for allies and determined to do his duty: to save Earth and forge a new
federation of planets.
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From reader reviews:

Zachary Mason:

The book Star Trek: Enterprise: The Romulan War: To Brave the Storm make one feel enjoy for your spare
time. You can use to make your capable far more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you
getting strain or having big problem with your subject. If you can make reading through a book Star Trek:
Enterprise: The Romulan War: To Brave the Storm to become your habit, you can get a lot more advantages,
like add your own capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. You can know everything if
you like start and read a e-book Star Trek: Enterprise: The Romulan War: To Brave the Storm. Kinds of
book are several. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about this
book?

Jason Carr:

The reason why? Because this Star Trek: Enterprise: The Romulan War: To Brave the Storm is an
unordinary book that the inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will shock you with
the secret that inside. Reading this book alongside it was fantastic author who also write the book in such
incredible way makes the content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining method but still convey the
meaning entirely. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret
it. This phenomenal book will give you a lot of gains than the other book have got such as help improving
your skill and your critical thinking means. So , still want to delay having that book? If I ended up you I will
go to the reserve store hurriedly.

Nancy Lord:

The book untitled Star Trek: Enterprise: The Romulan War: To Brave the Storm contain a lot of information
on the item. The writer explains the woman idea with easy method. The language is very simple to
implement all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was authored
by famous author. The author will bring you in the new age of literary works. You can actually read this
book because you can continue reading your smart phone, or model, so you can read the book with anywhere
and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open their official web-site along with order it. Have a
nice learn.

Dustin Broach:

A lot of guide has printed but it differs. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the very
best book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is named of book
Star Trek: Enterprise: The Romulan War: To Brave the Storm. You can add your knowledge by it. Without
making the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most significant
that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one location to other place.
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