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Counterclaims, the right of a State sued by another State to bring its own counter-suit in the course of the
same trial, may offer an opportunity to mitigate the effects of the original suit and help to resolve disputes
between States that have more than one aspect. In recent years, counterclaims have been frequently presented
at the International Court of Justice (ICJ).
This book examines the counterclaims presented at the ICJ and at its predecessor, the Permanent Court of
International Justice (PCIJ), during its 65 years of existence. It is the first study that focuses exclusively on
the subject of counterclaims. It analyses the evolution of the germane provisions in the PCIJ and ICJ Rules of
Procedure and the practice of the Court, especially in light of the relevant case-law of the ICJ.
A useful source for academics and practitioners in International law.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Madden:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important usually. The book Counterclaims before the International Court of
Justice ended up being making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more
information. It is extremely advantages for you. The publication Counterclaims before the International
Court of Justice is not only giving you much more new information but also being your friend when you
truly feel bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship with
all the book Counterclaims before the International Court of Justice. You never sense lose out for everything
in the event you read some books.

Harriette Corwin:

Do you considered one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on
guys that aren't like that. This Counterclaims before the International Court of Justice book is readable
through you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable reading
through experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer
of Counterclaims before the International Court of Justice content conveys thinking easily to understand by
many individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the information but it just different such as it.
So , do you still thinking Counterclaims before the International Court of Justice is not loveable to be your
top checklist reading book?

Effie Peoples:

This book untitled Counterclaims before the International Court of Justice to be one of several books this
best seller in this year, here is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit into it. You
will easily to buy this kind of book in the book retail outlet or you can order it via online. The publisher in
this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, since you can read this book in
your Mobile phone. So there is no reason to your account to past this reserve from your list.

Irene Robertson:

Within this era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more treasured
than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you
must do is just spending your time very little but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of
many books in the top checklist in your reading list is definitely Counterclaims before the International Court
of Justice. This book that is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in becoming precious person.
By looking right up and review this guide you can get many advantages.
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