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During the tumultuous year of 2008--when gas prices reached $4 a gallon, Amtrak set ridership records, and
a commuter train collided with a freight train in California--journalist James McCommons spent a year on
America's trains, talking to the people who ride and work the rails throughout much of the Amtrak system.
Organized around these rail journeys, Waiting on a Train is equal parts travel narrative, personal memoir,
and investigative journalism.

Readers meet the historians, railroad executives, transportation officials, politicians, government regulators,
railroad lobbyists, and passenger-rail advocates who are rallying around a simple question: Why has the
greatest railroad nation in the world turned its back on the very form of transportation that made modern life
and mobility possible?

Distrust of railroads in the nineteenth century, overregulation in the twentieth, and heavy government
subsidies for airports and roads have left the country with a skeletal intercity passenger-rail system. Amtrak
has endured for decades, and yet failed to prosper owing to a lack of political and financial support and an
uneasy relationship with the big, remaining railroads.

While riding the rails, McCommons explores how the country may move passenger rail forward in America-
-and what role government should play in creating and funding mass-transportation systems. Against the
backdrop of the nation's stimulus program, he explores what it will take to build high-speed trains and
transportation networks, and when the promise of rail will be realized in America.
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From reader reviews:

Manuel Coury:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading
routine give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the
information inside the book that improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what
kind of e-book you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with training books but if you want sense
happy read one having theme for entertaining like comic or novel. Often the Waiting on a Train: The
Embattled Future of Passenger Rail Service is kind of book which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Leo Osborne:

This Waiting on a Train: The Embattled Future of Passenger Rail Service are generally reliable for you who
want to become a successful person, why. The explanation of this Waiting on a Train: The Embattled Future
of Passenger Rail Service can be one of many great books you must have is definitely giving you more than
just simple reading food but feed a person with information that might be will shock your preceding
knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your conditions in the e-
book and printed types. Beside that this Waiting on a Train: The Embattled Future of Passenger Rail Service
forcing you to have an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical
thinking that we all know it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Thomas Woods:

This Waiting on a Train: The Embattled Future of Passenger Rail Service is great e-book for you because the
content that is certainly full of information for you who else always deal with world and possess to make
decision every minute. This particular book reveal it information accurately using great organize word or we
can claim no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read that hurriedly you can have whole information in
it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but challenging core information with splendid
delivering sentences. Having Waiting on a Train: The Embattled Future of Passenger Rail Service in your
hand like having the world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no book that offer you
world within ten or fifteen minute right but this guide already do that. So , this can be good reading book.
Hey there Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt which?

David Shields:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
from the book. Book is prepared or printed or illustrated from each source this filled update of news. Within
this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social similar
to newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add your
knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just searching
for the Waiting on a Train: The Embattled Future of Passenger Rail Service when you required it?
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