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Beyond Grief explores high-style funerary sculptures and their functions during the turn of the twentieth
century. Many scholars have overlooked these monuments, viewing them as mere oddities, a part of an
individual artist's oeuvre, a detail of a patron's biography, or local civic cemetery history. This volume
considers them in terms of their wider context and shifting use as objects of consolation, power, and
multisensory mystery and wonder.

Art historian Cynthia Mills traces the stories of four families who memorialized their losses through
sculpture. Henry Brooks Adams commissioned perhaps the most famous American cemetery monument of
all, the Adams Memorial in Washington, D.C. The bronze figure was designed by Augustus Saint-Gaudens,
who became the nation’s foremost sculptor. Another innovative bronze monument featured the Milmore
brothers, who had worked together as sculptors in the Boston area. Artist Frank Duveneck composed a
recumbent portrait of his wife following her early death in Paris; in Rome, the aging William Wetmore Story
made an angel of grief his last work as a symbol of his sheer desolation after his wife’s death.

Through these incredible monuments Mills explores questions like: Why did new forms--many of them now
produced in bronze rather than stone and placed in architectural settings--arise just at this time, and how did
they mesh or clash with the sensibilities of their era? Why was there a gap between the intention of these
elite patrons and artists, whose lives were often intertwined in a closed circle, and the way some public
audiences received them through the filter of the mass media? Beyond Grief traces the monuments' creation,
influence, and reception in the hope that they will help us to understand the larger story: how survivors used
cemetery memorials as a vehicle to mourn and remember, and how their meaning changed over time.
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From reader reviews:

Katie Phillips:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive now,
people have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place
and notice simply by surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated this for a while is
reading. Yes, by reading a publication your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand than other is
high. For you who want to start reading any book, we give you this Beyond Grief: Sculpture and Wonder in
the Gilded Age Cemetery book as basic and daily reading book. Why, because this book is usually more than
just a book.

David Giles:

Exactly why? Because this Beyond Grief: Sculpture and Wonder in the Gilded Age Cemetery is an
unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap it but latter it will jolt you with the secret
it inside. Reading this book close to it was fantastic author who have write the book in such amazing way
makes the content inside easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is
good for you because of not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This book will give you
a lot of gains than the other book include such as help improving your talent and your critical thinking way.
So , still want to delay having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Ray Chung:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book especially book
entitled Beyond Grief: Sculpture and Wonder in the Gilded Age Cemetery your head will drift away trough
every dimension, wandering in each aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely will become your mind
friends. Imaging just about every word written in a reserve then become one contact form conclusion and
explanation which maybe you never get just before. The Beyond Grief: Sculpture and Wonder in the Gilded
Age Cemetery giving you an additional experience more than blown away your head but also giving you
useful details for your better life in this particular era. So now let us explain to you the relaxing pattern at this
point is your body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning a. Do
you want to try this extraordinary spending spare time activity?

Raymond Smith:

It is possible to spend your free time you just read this book this e-book. This Beyond Grief: Sculpture and
Wonder in the Gilded Age Cemetery is simple to deliver you can read it in the area, in the beach, train and
soon. If you did not possess much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is
make you simpler to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits
that you will get when you buy this book.
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