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The Anglo-Zulu War of 1879 still intrigues both scholars and enthusiasts alike more than 130 years after it
was fought. Its story contains tragedy, high drama and the heavy loss of human life; it involved five major
battles and two lesser fights; and led to the snuffing out of the direct male Napoleonic line of France. And all
this in less than one year.??Reflecting on several years' research, Keith Smith presents a series of essays
which explore hitherto unanswered questions and offer fresh insights into the key battles and protagonists of
this epic conflict. He presents some surprising conclusions which differ, often radically, from more orthodox
views.??He also sets out to reveal the characters of the men – of both sides – who might otherwise have been
simply names on a page. They are not: they lived, loved, fought and died. Some were heroes while others
were less than that. Most were ordinary men who chose a military career and did their best as far as they
were able. White or black, British or colonial, they are all brought to life and their unique stories told. This is
an important contribution to our understanding of this famous war and the men who fought in it.
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From reader reviews:

Brian Andres:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a go
walking, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open as well as read a book titled Dead Was Everything:
Studies in the Anglo-Zulu War? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You understand beside you can
spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with their opinion
or you have various other opinion?

Susan Ross:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they are still students or this for all people in
the world, what best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has
various personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they don't
would like do that. You must know how great and important the book Dead Was Everything: Studies in the
Anglo-Zulu War. All type of book is it possible to see on many options. You can look for the internet
methods or other social media.

Helen Williams:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the free time or they will
get lot of stress from both way of life and work. So , once we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely yes. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity are
there when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then do you
try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the book you have
read will be Dead Was Everything: Studies in the Anglo-Zulu War.

Lucy Carson:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you might have it in e-
book technique, more simple and reachable. This kind of Dead Was Everything: Studies in the Anglo-Zulu
War can give you a lot of buddies because by you taking a look at this one book you have thing that they
don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. That book can be one of a step for you to get
success. This publication offer you information that probably your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing
more than some other make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? We should have Dead Was
Everything: Studies in the Anglo-Zulu War.
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