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As the war in Europe entered its final months, we teetered on the edge of a Third World War. While Soviet
forces smashed their way into Berlin, Churchill ordered British military planners to prepare the top secret
Operation Unthinkable - the plan for an Allied attack on the Soviet Union, on 1 July 1945. Using US, British
and Polish forces, the invasion would reclaim Eastern Europe. The plan called for the use of the atomic
bomb and Nazi troops if necessary, more than merely controversial, as the extent of the Holocaust was
becoming clear. Would yet another army make the fatal mistake of heading East? In Operation Unthinkable
Jonathan Walker presents a haunting study of the war that so nearly was. He outlines the motivations behind
Churchill's plan, the logistics of launching a vast assault against an enemy who had bested Hitler, potential
sabotage by Polish communists, and whether the Allies would have succeeded. Well supported by a wide
range of primary sources from the Polish Underground Museum Study Trust, Sikorski Institute, National
Archives and Imperial War Museum, this is a fascinating insight into the upheaval as the Second World War
drew to a close and the Allies' mistrust of the Soviet Union that would blossom into the Cold War.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Alexander:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take
a go walking, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or even read a book allowed
Operation Unthinkable: The Third World War: British Plans to Attack the Soviet Empire 1945? Maybe it is
to get best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you
can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have other opinion?

Jennifer Oaks:

Book is definitely written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can realize everything you want by a e-
book. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important issue to bring us around the world.
Next to that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A book Operation Unthinkable: The Third World
War: British Plans to Attack the Soviet Empire 1945 will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel
much more confidence if you can know about almost everything. But some of you think this open or reading
any book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you in search of
best book or acceptable book with you?

Vicki Harris:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book was rare? Why so many
query for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some people likes
looking at, not only science book but novel and Operation Unthinkable: The Third World War: British Plans
to Attack the Soviet Empire 1945 or even others sources were given know-how for you. After you know how
the truly amazing a book, you feel need to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or
perhaps students especially. Those ebooks are helping them to add their knowledge. In different case, beside
science guide, any other book likes Operation Unthinkable: The Third World War: British Plans to Attack
the Soviet Empire 1945 to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like this.

Samuel Ware:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library as well as
to make summary for some book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's heart or real their
hobby. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time there but
nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring along with can't
see colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important to suit your
needs. As we know that on this period, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to
reach Chinese's country. Therefore this Operation Unthinkable: The Third World War: British Plans to
Attack the Soviet Empire 1945 can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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