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Painstakingly honest, this chilling memoir reveals how a teenager became immersed in the bizarre life of
legendary porn star John Holmes. Starting with a childhood that molded her perfectly to fall for the seduction
of “the king of porn,” this autobiography recounts the perilous road that Dawn Schiller traveled—from drugs
and addiction to beatings, arrests, forced prostitution, and being sold to the drug underworld. After living
through the horrific Wonderland murders of 1981, she entered protective custody, ran from the FBI, and
turned in John Holmes to the police. This is the true story of a young girl’s harrowing escape from one of the
most infamous public figures, her struggle to survive, and her recovery from unthinkable abuse.
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From reader reviews:

Walter Godinez:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
That's why, you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their spare
time to take a stroll, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open as well as read a book entitled
The Road Through Wonderland: Surviving John Holmes (5 Year Anniversary)? Maybe it is to get best
activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can more
intelligent than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have some other opinion?

Brian Faber:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading addiction
give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside
the book that will improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of
guide you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want truly feel
happy read one using theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. Often the The Road Through
Wonderland: Surviving John Holmes (5 Year Anniversary) is kind of publication which is giving the reader
unforeseen experience.

Robert Carroll:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many issue for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes reading,
not only science book but additionally novel and The Road Through Wonderland: Surviving John Holmes (5
Year Anniversary) or perhaps others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how the
fantastic a book, you feel need to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher or even
students especially. Those guides are helping them to bring their knowledge. In additional case, beside
science e-book, any other book likes The Road Through Wonderland: Surviving John Holmes (5 Year
Anniversary) to make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like this one.

Gladys Jackson:

Reserve is one of source of understanding. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen will need book to know the revise information of year to year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the
world. Through the book The Road Through Wonderland: Surviving John Holmes (5 Year Anniversary) we
can take more advantage. Don't that you be creative people? To get creative person must want to read a book.
Merely choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life at this time book
The Road Through Wonderland: Surviving John Holmes (5 Year Anniversary). You can more attractive than
now.
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