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In this memoir, the author casts a wry and self-deprecating look back on her childhood, with anecdotes about
the chance events and comic ironies that make up a life. Rifke (Rosalie Wise Sharp) grew up in North
Toronto, which felt to her like a foreign place because there were no other Jewish families there in the late
1930s. Yiddish was spoken in her household, and the food, dress, and customs of Ozarow—the Polish shtetl
(small Jewish town) from which her parents emigrated—were all maintained. Rifke's peers took lessons in
tap dancing, ice skating, the piano, and the flute—activities that didn't translate into the Yiddish vocabulary,
where only hard work, no-nonsense, and book learning were permitted. Rifke secretly decided to pass as a
gentile, joining a bible class and the Christmas choir, and she was guilty about her pursuit of these activities
during the war, when her mother was frantic with fear that their family in Poland was being slaughtered by
the Nazis. In high school, Rifke's life changed: it was there that she met and married her soul mate Isadore,
who worked in the construction business, much to her parents' disappointment. Prosperity took time,
however, and Isadore's audacious dream to build a world-class hotel chain, The Four Seasons, came to pass.
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From reader reviews:

Steven Zakrzewski:

The particular book Rifke an Improbable Life will bring that you the new experience of reading some sort of
book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book to study, this book very
acceptable to you. The book Rifke an Improbable Life is much recommended to you to read. You can also
get the e-book in the official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Timothy Larios:

You may spend your free time to learn this book this book. This Rifke an Improbable Life is simple bringing
you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not have much space
to bring the particular printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You
can save often the book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you
buy this book.

Jennifer Nava:

This Rifke an Improbable Life is brand new way for you who has interest to look for some information since
it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge more you know or else you
who still having little digest in reading this Rifke an Improbable Life can be the light food for you personally
because the information inside this particular book is easy to get through anyone. These books acquire itself
in the form which is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book web form. People who think that in e-
book form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So there is no in reading a guide
especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for an individual. So , don't miss
the item! Just read this e-book style for your better life and also knowledge.

Lloyd Gilbert:

You can get this Rifke an Improbable Life by browse the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it
could to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this publication are
various. Not only through written or printed and also can you enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern
era just like now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now,
choose your current ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most important to arrange you to
ultimately make your knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.
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