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Adam and Eve were Pharaoh Akhenaton and Nefertiti.

The Bible says that a river flowed through the Garden of Eden and then split into four branches. There is
only one river in the Near East that does exactly this, and that is the long oasis-garden of the Nile valley and
its division into the (originally) four branches of the Nile Delta. 

This observation takes Ralph into the depths of the Genesis account, and it would seem that Adam and Eve
were actually Akhenaton and Nefertiti; and so the Genesis story is actually a distillation of Akhenaton's
Hymn to the Aten. Thus the Garden of Eden was originally the Garden of Aten (Akhenaton's god) at Amarna
in Middle Egypt. 

The book also demonstrates that Hebrew is a direct descendant of the ancient Egyptian language, and that the
Bible was written in Egyptian. Sequel to "Tempest & Exodus" and "Solomon, Pharaoh of Egypt"
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From reader reviews:

Gary Glover:

The book Eden in Egypt: Adam and Eve Were Pharaoh Akhenaton and Nefertiti (Egyptian Testament) can
give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. Exactly why must
we leave the great thing like a book Eden in Egypt: Adam and Eve Were Pharaoh Akhenaton and Nefertiti
(Egyptian Testament)? Several of you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim this book can give
many data for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or
information that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you may share all of these. Book Eden
in Egypt: Adam and Eve Were Pharaoh Akhenaton and Nefertiti (Egyptian Testament) has simple shape but
the truth is know: it has great and large function for you. You can search the enormous world by available
and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Susan Velez:

Do you one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on guys this
particular aren't like that. This Eden in Egypt: Adam and Eve Were Pharaoh Akhenaton and Nefertiti
(Egyptian Testament) book is readable simply by you who hate the straight word style. You will find the info
here are arrange for enjoyable examining experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that
want to provide to you. The writer associated with Eden in Egypt: Adam and Eve Were Pharaoh Akhenaton
and Nefertiti (Egyptian Testament) content conveys the idea easily to understand by many individuals. The
printed and e-book are not different in the written content but it just different by means of it. So , do you
continue to thinking Eden in Egypt: Adam and Eve Were Pharaoh Akhenaton and Nefertiti (Egyptian
Testament) is not loveable to be your top listing reading book?

Clayton Medina:

The book untitled Eden in Egypt: Adam and Eve Were Pharaoh Akhenaton and Nefertiti (Egyptian
Testament) is the reserve that recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the guide content that
will be shown to you. The language that creator use to explained their way of doing something is easily to
understand. The article writer was did a lot of investigation when write the book, therefore the information
that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You also could possibly get the e-book of Eden in Egypt: Adam
and Eve Were Pharaoh Akhenaton and Nefertiti (Egyptian Testament) from the publisher to make you
considerably more enjoy free time.

Mae Mosley:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this Eden in Egypt: Adam and Eve Were
Pharaoh Akhenaton and Nefertiti (Egyptian Testament) publication written by well-known writer we are
excited for well how to make book which might be understand by anyone who read the book. Written
throughout good manner for you, leaking every ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your own



personal hunger then you still skepticism Eden in Egypt: Adam and Eve Were Pharaoh Akhenaton and
Nefertiti (Egyptian Testament) as good book not merely by the cover but also by content. This is one
publication that can break don't judge book by its cover, so do you still needing yet another sixth sense to
pick this kind of!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to
one more sixth sense.
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