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The idea of the complete annihilation of all life is a powerful and culturally universal concept. As human
societies around the globe have produced creation myths, so too have they created narratives concerning the
apocalyptic destruction of their worlds. This book explores the idea of the apocalypse and its reception
within culture and society, bringing together 17 essays which explore both the influence and innovation of
apocalyptic ideas from classical Greek and Roman writings to the foreign policies of the contemporary
United States. The book begins with an essay which serves as a microcosm for the remaining collection,
exploring the points of convergence and divergence among medieval Christian and contemporary secular
apocalyptic ideas. The first half of the book invites readers to explore ancient, medieval, early modern, and
modern popular conceptions of the apocalypse. The second half focuses on the continuance of apocalyptic
expectations and how they are understood within the realms of contemporary politics and popular culture.
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From reader reviews:

Linda Brown:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing for us
to know everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or goal; it means that book has different
type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They may be reading
whatever they take because their hobby is actually reading a book. What about the person who don't like
looking at a book? Sometime, individual feel need book once they found difficult problem or maybe
exercise. Well, probably you will require this End of Days: Essays on the Apocalypse from Antiquity to
Modernity.

Janice Oconnell:

The book End of Days: Essays on the Apocalypse from Antiquity to Modernity can give more knowledge
and also the precise product information about everything you want. Why must we leave the great thing like
a book End of Days: Essays on the Apocalypse from Antiquity to Modernity? Some of you have a different
opinion about guide. But one aim in which book can give many info for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right
now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you may give for each
other; you are able to share all of these. Book End of Days: Essays on the Apocalypse from Antiquity to
Modernity has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and large function for you. You can
appearance the enormous world by wide open and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Lawrence Richardson:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them household
or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or maybe
playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different you can
read some sort of book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the
entire day to reading a publication. The book End of Days: Essays on the Apocalypse from Antiquity to
Modernity it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. These
were enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy
often the e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book out of your smart phone. The price is not too
costly but this book has high quality.

Francisco London:

You can spend your free time to study this book this book. This End of Days: Essays on the Apocalypse
from Antiquity to Modernity is simple to deliver you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train along
with soon. If you did not have much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is
make you quicker to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of
benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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