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This story was originally published in Day One, a weekly literary journal dedicated to short fiction and
poetry from emerging writers.

Award-winning Korean writer Bae Suah tells the story of a young woman in search of meaning as she
considers her fate in modern Seoul. For this aspiring artist, there seems to be no escape from life’s
monotony. After leaving her family under the pretense of having fallen in love, she resigns herself to a
solitary life rather than succumb to the relentless cultural pressure she feels to exchange her freedom for
marriage. Numb to sex and unmoved by love, she begins to lose her grip on reality as those around her fall
short of their own aspirations. Confused about the interplay between past and present and unsure of her own
desire to live into the future, Highway with Green Apples is a surreal and mesmerizing tale of a young life
slowly unraveling.
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From reader reviews:

Lois Jennings:

Do you among people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on guys this
kind of aren't like that. This Highway with Green Apples (Kindle Single) (A Short Story) book is readable
through you who hate those straight word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable
studying experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer
associated with Highway with Green Apples (Kindle Single) (A Short Story) content conveys thinking easily
to understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the information but it just
different such as it. So , do you still thinking Highway with Green Apples (Kindle Single) (A Short Story) is
not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Wayne Sutphin:

This Highway with Green Apples (Kindle Single) (A Short Story) is brand-new way for you who has
fascination to look for some information because it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you onto it getting
knowledge more you know or else you who still having little digest in reading this Highway with Green
Apples (Kindle Single) (A Short Story) can be the light food to suit your needs because the information
inside this particular book is easy to get by means of anyone. These books build itself in the form that is
certainly reachable by anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book form. People who think that in publication
form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a book
especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for an individual. So , don't miss the
idea! Just read this e-book kind for your better life along with knowledge.

John Gravatt:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you could have it in e-
book means, more simple and reachable. This kind of Highway with Green Apples (Kindle Single) (A Short
Story) can give you a lot of pals because by you checking out this one book you have issue that they don't
and make you more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for you to get
success. This reserve offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than
various other make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? We should have Highway with Green Apples
(Kindle Single) (A Short Story).

Henry Heath:

A number of people said that they feel weary when they reading a publication. They are directly felt it when
they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the particular book Highway with Green Apples (Kindle
Single) (A Short Story) to make your reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading proficiency is
developing when you such as reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy you just read it and
mingle the sensation about book and looking at especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to wide



open a book and read it. Beside that the reserve Highway with Green Apples (Kindle Single) (A Short Story)
can to be a newly purchased friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse with the information must you're
doing of this time.
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