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Explore the Hadoop MapReduce v2 ecosystem to gain insights from very large datasets

About This Book

Process large and complex datasets using next generation Hadoop●

Install, configure, and administer MapReduce programs and learn what’s new in MapReduce v2●

More than 90 Hadoop MapReduce recipes presented in a simple and straightforward manner, with step-by-●

step instructions and real-world examples

Who This Book Is For

If you are a Big Data enthusiast and wish to use Hadoop v2 to solve your problems, then this book is for you.
This book is for Java programmers with little to moderate knowledge of Hadoop MapReduce. This is also a
one-stop reference for developers and system admins who want to quickly get up to speed with using
Hadoop v2. It would be helpful to have a basic knowledge of software development using Java and a basic
working knowledge of Linux.

What You Will Learn

Configure and administer Hadoop YARN, MapReduce v2, and HDFS clusters●

Use Hive, HBase, Pig, Mahout, and Nutch with Hadoop v2 to solve your big data problems easily and●

effectively
Solve large-scale analytics problems using MapReduce-based applications●

Tackle complex problems such as classifications, finding relationships, online marketing,●

recommendations, and searching using Hadoop MapReduce and other related projects
Perform massive text data processing using Hadoop MapReduce and other related projects●

Deploy your clusters to cloud environments●

In Detail

Starting with installing Hadoop YARN, MapReduce, HDFS, and other Hadoop ecosystem components, with
this book, you will soon learn about many exciting topics such as MapReduce patterns, using Hadoop to
solve analytics, classifications, online marketing, recommendations, and data indexing and searching. You
will learn how to take advantage of Hadoop ecosystem projects including Hive, HBase, Pig, Mahout, Nutch,
and Giraph and be introduced to deploying in cloud environments.

Finally, you will be able to apply the knowledge you have gained to your own real-world scenarios to
achieve the best-possible results.
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From reader reviews:

Marie Velasquez:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to be aware of everything in the world. Each book has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that e-
book has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They can be reading
whatever they have because their hobby is definitely reading a book. How about the person who don't like
studying a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book whenever they found difficult problem as well as
exercise. Well, probably you will need this Hadoop MapReduce v2 Cookbook - Second Edition.

Katie Barry:

Inside other case, little persons like to read book Hadoop MapReduce v2 Cookbook - Second Edition. You
can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book. As long as we know about how is important any
book Hadoop MapReduce v2 Cookbook - Second Edition. You can add knowledge and of course you can
around the world by the book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can recognize everything!
From your country until foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you
can know that. In this era, we could open a book or perhaps searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book.
You need to use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's go through.

Carmen Helton:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind talent
or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book as compared to can
satisfy your limited time to read it because all of this time you only find e-book that need more time to be
learn. Hadoop MapReduce v2 Cookbook - Second Edition can be your answer because it can be read by a
person who have those short extra time problems.

Rachel Morris:

The book untitled Hadoop MapReduce v2 Cookbook - Second Edition contain a lot of information on it. The
writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy technique. The language is very clear and understandable all
the people, so do not necessarily worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was compiled by famous
author. The author will bring you in the new era of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you
can continue reading your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and
anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site in addition
to order it. Have a nice read.
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