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In Healing Lyme Disease Naturally, anthropologist Wolf D. Storl shares his own success in overcoming a
difficult, sometimes deadly disease that is reaching epidemic proportions. When he was diagnosed, Dr. Storl
refused standard treatments because of antibiotic intolerance. Instead, he researched healing systems of
various cultures including Traditional Chinese Medicine, American Indian healing practices, homeopathy,
and traditional Western herbal lore and discovered the teasel root. Teasel, a flowering plant that grows
throughout Europe and Asia, tonifies the liver and kidneys, promotes blood circulation, and strengthens the
bones and tendons. The plant has been documented to help cure chronic conditions marked by arthritis, sore,
stiff muscles, and eventual incapacitation—all symptoms associated with Lyme disease. Dr. Storl’s approach
consists of flushing out toxins and inhibiting bacteria by using teasel root as tincture, powder, or tea
(available for purchase online and in natural foods stores); stimulating the immune system and detoxifying
the body by exposing it to extreme heat (sweat lodges and Japanese baths); and dietary and naturopathic
measures, including fresh natural food, exercise, and sufficient sleep. Written in an encouraging, personal
tone but based in science and clinical studies, Healing Lyme Disease Naturally offers hope in combating a
condition that has stubbornly resisted conventional medical treatment.
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From reader reviews:

Roberto Reyes:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your short lived problem;
you can add your knowledge by the publication entitled Healing Lyme Disease Naturally: History, Analysis,
and Treatments. Try to the actual book Healing Lyme Disease Naturally: History, Analysis, and Treatments
as your close friend. It means that it can to get your friend when you truly feel alone and beside regarding
course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you
considerably more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , let's make new experience
along with knowledge with this book.

Virginia McNally:

The book Healing Lyme Disease Naturally: History, Analysis, and Treatments make you feel enjoy for your
spare time. You need to use to make your capable far more increase. Book can being your best friend when
you getting pressure or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make examining a book
Healing Lyme Disease Naturally: History, Analysis, and Treatments to be your habit, you can get
considerably more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about several or all
subjects. You may know everything if you like open up and read a reserve Healing Lyme Disease Naturally:
History, Analysis, and Treatments. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or
other individuals. So , how do you think about this publication?

Jose Higham:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As it is known to us
that book is very important usually. The book Healing Lyme Disease Naturally: History, Analysis, and
Treatments was making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take more
information. It is rather advantages for you. The e-book Healing Lyme Disease Naturally: History, Analysis,
and Treatments is not only giving you much more new information but also to be your friend when you truly
feel bored. You can spend your current spend time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship with the
book Healing Lyme Disease Naturally: History, Analysis, and Treatments. You never sense lose out for
everything if you read some books.

Kenneth Porter:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Make an effort to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't determine book by its
include may doesn't work this is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not because
fantastic as in the outside search likes. Maybe you answer is usually Healing Lyme Disease Naturally:
History, Analysis, and Treatments why because the great cover that make you consider in regards to the



content will not disappoint a person. The inside or content is usually fantastic as the outside as well as cover.
Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.
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