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HORA DE DORMIR DEL CONEJO is a beautifully translated bilingual edition of Nancy Elizabeth
Wallace’s popular RABBIT'S BEDTIME. Each page contains the Spanish text, followed by the English text
in italics. The lyrical words and simple, colorful artwork invite readers young and old to reflect on a day well
spent.
Published last spring, the English edition of RABBIT'S BEDTIME received great acclaim. It was chosen for
the Read to Grow literacy program. Here is what Kirkus Reviews had to say about the book: “As a young
rabbit prepares for sleep, the pleasures of the day are recounted in couplets: ‘Time with others. Time alone.
Time to nurture seeds I’ve sown.’ In the day, there was also time to play, sing, cuddle, and hug. Each activity
is impressively captured in Wallace’s distinctive cut-paper artwork; the colors invite readers to linger, and
the scenes are immediately recognizable. The positions struck by the rabbits — e.g., two bunnies dancing
about in the spray of a sprinkler — are remarkably natural. While the rhymes and imagery are highly
accessible, Wallace has added incidentals that expand the age range for the book, such as ladybugs,
dragonflies, or a crab in a fish tank, that are fun to discover and identify.”
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From reader reviews:

Elizabeth Murphy:

The experience that you get from Rabbit's Bedtime Spanish/English Edition : Hora De Dormir Del is the
more deep you searching the information that hide within the words the more you get thinking about reading
it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to recognise but Rabbit's Bedtime Spanish/English Edition : Hora De
Dormir Del giving you buzz feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in certain way that can
be understood by means of anyone who read the item because the author of this book is well-known enough.
This kind of book also makes your vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go along,
both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for having that Rabbit's Bedtime
Spanish/English Edition : Hora De Dormir Del instantly.

Jeffrey Barclay:

The book untitled Rabbit's Bedtime Spanish/English Edition : Hora De Dormir Del is the book that
recommended to you to read. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to you. The
language that article author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The copy writer was did a
lot of exploration when write the book, so the information that they share to your account is absolutely
accurate. You also could possibly get the e-book of Rabbit's Bedtime Spanish/English Edition : Hora De
Dormir Del from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Luther Brown:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you, why because this Rabbit's Bedtime Spanish/English Edition :
Hora De Dormir Del publication written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book
which might be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written throughout good manner for you,
leaking every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still doubt Rabbit's
Bedtime Spanish/English Edition : Hora De Dormir Del as good book not only by the cover but also with the
content. This is one publication that can break don't assess book by its cover, so do you still needing yet
another sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already told you so why
you have to listening to an additional sixth sense.

Nicole Dilbeck:

As we know that book is important thing to add our information for everything. By a book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This guide Rabbit's Bedtime Spanish/English Edition : Hora De Dormir Del was filled
with regards to science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines
competence. Some people has various feel when they reading a book. If you know how big selling point of a
book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book that you
wanted.
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