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A 2010 OCLC report found that an internet-accessible finding aid existed for only 44 percent of archival
collections. Undescribed collections are essentially hidden from users, and much of the blame can be
assigned to the strain of processing backlogs. Extensible processing offers an alternative, allowing collection
managers to first establish a baseline level of access to all holdings, then conduct additional processing based
on user demand and ongoing assessment. Adhering to archival principles and standards, this flexible
approach emphasizes decision-making and prioritization. Santamaria, recipient of the Society of American
Archivists' 2013 Coker Award for innovative developments in archival description, has overseen the
processing of thousands of linear feet of organizational records and personal papers. Showing how technical
services staff can reassert control of collections while improving user experience, in this invaluable book he

Lays out the six key principles of extensible processing, from creating a baseline level of access to all●

collections material and crafting standardized, structured descriptions to managing archival materials in the
aggregate
Provides a start-to-finish workflow adaptable to any collection, with practical tips such as using collection●

assessment surveys to reduce backlog
Advises how to limit physical handling and processing through a holistic approach●

Explains the use of Describing Archives: A Content Standard (DACS) and Encoded Archival Description●

(EAD)
Covers recent developments in the digitization of archives, including alternative strategies like low-●

resolution scanning and repurposing existing metadata
Presents several case studies, ranging from a one person shop to large universities, that include examples of●

processes, systems, software, and metadata

Archivists and special collections librarians will find in this book the tools, confidence, and freedom to
improve user experience through extensible processing
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From reader reviews:

James Mace:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information presently can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even restricted. What people must be consider
while those information which is in the former life are hard to be find than now could be taking seriously
which one works to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable resource
then you get it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will
not happen throughout you if you take Extensible Processing for Archives and Special Collections: Reducing
Processing Backlogs as the daily resource information.

Jose Williams:

Reading a book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With reading you can get a lot
of information which will give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world could share
their idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their very own reader
with their story as well as their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the publications. But also they
write about the information about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl,
or how to teach your kids, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors these days always try
to improve their expertise in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write with their book.
One of them is this Extensible Processing for Archives and Special Collections: Reducing Processing
Backlogs.

Gay Swiderski:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or their very own friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, about to beach,
or picnic inside the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different
to fill your own free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book may be option to fill your cost-free time/ holiday.
The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to consider
look for book, may be the publication untitled Extensible Processing for Archives and Special Collections:
Reducing Processing Backlogs can be excellent book to read. May be it could be best activity to you.

Mamie Contreras:

A number of people said that they feel weary when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half parts of the book. You can choose the book Extensible Processing for Archives and
Special Collections: Reducing Processing Backlogs to make your own personal reading is interesting. Your
personal skill of reading talent is developing when you like reading. Try to choose straightforward book to
make you enjoy to see it and mingle the idea about book and looking at especially. It is to be initial opinion
for you to like to available a book and study it. Beside that the e-book Extensible Processing for Archives



and Special Collections: Reducing Processing Backlogs can to be your brand-new friend when you're sense
alone and confuse using what must you're doing of this time.
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