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For fans of the Nubian Underworld series, this first book in the gritty, new Kink, P.I. series introduces
former APD detective Dominic Law who knows one thing for certain: you can never predict who or what
might turn up next.

“Hate me or love me, I get results…”

When Dominic Law left the force for a more lucrative offer to run a friend’s private security firm, he thought
that his days of suffering as a police detective were over, and he could finally sit back, relax, and take the
cases that he wanted, when he wanted.

Was he ever wrong.

Before he can settle into his cushy new office and flirt with his sexy secretary, Dominic finds himself
entangled in the politics and rules that he thought he had left behind. A sexy detective assigned to the first
case keep his eyes and hands full, while another case unexpectedly reunites him with a former partner who
never forgave him for leaving the force…and for leaving her.

From the lustful scenes within the fetish and swingers’ nightclubs, to the relentless heat of the streets that he
used to walk as a rookie cop, Dominic is determined to solve the cases in a libidinous underworld where the
rules are different, and where nothing—and no one—is as they seem.
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From reader reviews:

Richard McCain:

The reserve untitled Obsession: The Kink, P.I. Series is the book that recommended to you to read. You can
see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to a person. The language that creator use to
explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The author was did a lot of investigation
when write the book, hence the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also could get
the e-book of Obsession: The Kink, P.I. Series from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

Gary Sandler:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, quick story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not seeking Obsession: The Kink, P.I. Series
that give your fun preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading practice all over the
world can be said as the opportinity for people to know world much better then how they react towards the
world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading routine only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants
to always be success person. So , for all of you who want to start examining as your good habit, you can pick
Obsession: The Kink, P.I. Series become your personal starter.

Kathy Graves:

Reading a book to get new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to go through a book. When you
learn a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, because
book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book that
you have read. If you need to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if you
want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, along with soon. The
Obsession: The Kink, P.I. Series will give you a new experience in reading a book.

Gilbert Pellerin:

Is it anyone who having spare time then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just lying on
the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Obsession: The Kink, P.I. Series can be the response, oh
how comes? It's a book you know. You are so out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this new
era is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?
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