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This work is Iqbal sfirst philosophical attempt and, therefore, is not free from the marks of immaturity ;and
yet until it is superseded by a more comprehensive work, it will retain its importance in Oriental studies. It
was written at a time when he was an admirer of pantheism a world view which he completely repudiated a
few years later. That is why he has spoken ii the introduction in such glowing terms of I bn-al-A rabi, xjas
given in the text practically no place to his future teacher and guide, Jalal-al-D in Rumi, and has paid more
attention to the treatment of Pantheistic Sufiism than to any other philosophical school. In his observations
regarding A l-F arabi, I bn-M askwaih and I bn-S ina, he has more or less echoed the views of early Western
Orientalists and has denied these great thinkers the credit for originality and deviation from Neo-P latonism.
There is no doubt that if he were to re-write this work, he would have differently evaluated their
philosophical efforts and would have also given toR umi sthought the extensive treatment it really deserved.
However, this work presents the first and the only historical account of Persia sphilosophical thought and the
credit of its conception goes to I qbal. He has successfully examined both Persian Idealism andR ealism and
in his analysis of the conditions that led to the rise of Sufiism, he has corrected the mistakes of his
predecessors. For a work of this type, the author must combine in himself scholarship in at least two Oriental
languages, Persian and A rabic, in one or more European languages, and in the History of Philosophy,
Eastern and Western. These qualifications were pre-eminently held by I qbal, and therefore he achieved what
no one without these qualifications could achieve. Besides, in representing, as it does, the first stage of Iqbal
sdevelopment, this treatise is of great value to the
(Typographical errors above are due to OCR software and don't occur in the book.)
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From reader reviews:

Rebecca Clark:

The particular book The Development of Metaphysics in Persia a Contribution to I (Classic Reprint) has a lot
of knowledge on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of help. The book was written
by the very famous author. Tom makes some research before write this book. This specific book very easy to
read you can find the point easily after looking over this book.

Andrew Hall:

The Development of Metaphysics in Persia a Contribution to I (Classic Reprint) can be one of your starter
books that are good idea. Many of us recommend that straight away because this e-book has good
vocabulary that may increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining but
nevertheless delivering the information. The article writer giving his/her effort to get every word into
satisfaction arrangement in writing The Development of Metaphysics in Persia a Contribution to I (Classic
Reprint) nevertheless doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm
resource details that maybe you can be among it. This great information may drawn you into fresh stage of
crucial thinking.

Ilene Cody:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray an individual, why because this The Development of Metaphysics in
Persia a Contribution to I (Classic Reprint) reserve written by well-known writer who really knows well how
to make book which might be understand by anyone who read the book. Written in good manner for you,
still dripping wet every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still hesitation
The Development of Metaphysics in Persia a Contribution to I (Classic Reprint) as good book not merely by
the cover but also through the content. This is one guide that can break don't ascertain book by its protect, so
do you still needing an additional sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense
already said so why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.

James Ensor:

As a college student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the
library in order to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's
soul or real their hobby. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to go to the library. They go to
presently there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring
as well as can't see colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for
you personally. As we know that on this age, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says,
ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore , this The Development of Metaphysics in Persia a Contribution
to I (Classic Reprint) can make you sense more interested to read.
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