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Winner of the 2007 Otto Kinkeldey Award from the American Musicological Society and the 2007 Deems
Taylor Award from the American Society of Composers, Authors, and Publishers.

Divas and Scholars is a dazzling and beguiling account of how opera comes to the stage, filled with Philip
Gossett’s personal experiences of triumphant—and even failed—performances and suffused with his
towering and tonic passion for music. Writing as a fan, a musician, and a scholar, Gossett, the
world's leading authority on the performance of Italian opera, brings colorfully to life the problems, and
occasionally the scandals, that attend the production of some of our most favorite operas. 

Gossett begins by tracing the social history of nineteenth-century Italian theaters in order to explain the
nature of the musical scores from which performers have long worked. He then illuminates the often hidden
but crucial negotiations opera scholars and opera conductors and performers: What does it mean to talk about
performing from a critical edition? How does one determine what music to perform when multiple versions
of an opera exist? What are the implications of omitting passages from an opera in a performance? In
addition to vexing questions such as these, Gossett also tackles issues of ornamentation and transposition in
vocal style, the matters of translation and adaptation, and even aspects of stage direction and set design. 

Throughout this extensive and passionate work, Gossett enlivens his history with reports from his own
experiences with major opera companies at venues ranging from the Metropolitan and Santa Fe operas to the
Rossini Opera Festival at Pesaro. The result is a book that will enthrall both aficionados of Italian opera and
newcomers seeking a reliable introduction to it—in all its incomparable grandeur and timeless allure.
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From reader reviews:

Melanie Tuck:

Here thing why this Divas and Scholars: Performing Italian Opera are different and trustworthy to be yours.
First of all reading through a book is good but it really depends in the content of it which is the content is as
delicious as food or not. Divas and Scholars: Performing Italian Opera giving you information deeper and in
different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no reserve that similar with Divas and
Scholars: Performing Italian Opera. It gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your own personal eyes
about the thing that will happened in the world which is maybe can be happened around you. You can bring
everywhere like in area, café, or even in your technique home by train. For anyone who is having difficulties
in bringing the branded book maybe the form of Divas and Scholars: Performing Italian Opera in e-book can
be your choice.

Alan Castorena:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family, or all
their friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic in the
park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to fill your
personal free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book may be option to fill your free time/ holiday. The first
thing that you will ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to consider look for
book, may be the guide untitled Divas and Scholars: Performing Italian Opera can be good book to read.
May be it may be best activity to you.

Tyler Smith:

Divas and Scholars: Performing Italian Opera can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. We all
recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary which could increase your
knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The copy
writer giving his/her effort to get every word into joy arrangement in writing Divas and Scholars: Performing
Italian Opera although doesn't forget the main place, giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm
resource details that maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great information could drawn you into fresh
stage of crucial contemplating.

Janelle Garrity:

This Divas and Scholars: Performing Italian Opera is great reserve for you because the content that is full of
information for you who also always deal with world and also have to make decision every minute. This
specific book reveal it information accurately using great organize word or we can point out no rambling
sentences inside it. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only offers
you straight forward sentences but difficult core information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having
Divas and Scholars: Performing Italian Opera in your hand like having the world in your arm, information in
it is not ridiculous one particular. We can say that no publication that offer you world in ten or fifteen second



right but this book already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you
still doubt this?
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