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"Drug Lord is the real thing. Raw, immediate, indispensable."—Don Winslow, author of The Power of Dog
and California Fire and Life

"The [drug smuggling] business goes on, the slaughtered dead pile up, the US agencies continue to ratchet up
their budgets, the prisons grow larger and all the real rules of the game are in this book, some kind of
masterpiece."—Charles Bowden, from the introduction

"Pablo Acosta was a living legend in his Mexican border town of Ojinaga. He smuggled tremendous
amounts of drugs into the United States; he survived numerous attempts on his power—and his life—by
rivals; and he blessed the town with charity and civic improvements. He was finally slain in 1987 during a
raid by Mexican officials with the cooperation of US law enforcement. Poppa has turned out a detailed and
exciting book, covering in depth Acosta's life; the other drug factions that battled with him; the village of
Ojinaga; and the logistics of the drug operation. The result is a nonfiction account with enough greed,
treachery, shoot-outs, and government corruption to fascinate true crime and crime fiction readers alike.
Highly recommended."—Library Journal

Terrence E. Poppa, an award-winning journalist, was a finalist for a 1987 Pulitzer Prize for his
investigations into the connection between crime and government in Mexico. He was featured in Standoff in
Mexico, a PBS production about fraudulent elections in Mexico. Due to his unique insights into the world of
Mexican drug trafficking, Poppa has been widely interviewed on radio and television, including Larry King
Live and The O'Reilly Factor.
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From reader reviews:

Lisa Gaither:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yeah, you can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent all their spare
time to take a walk, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book eligible
Drug Lord: A True Story: The Life and Death of a Mexican Kingpin? Maybe it is to become best activity for
you. You recognize beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than
before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have different opinion?

Katherine Lee:

Reading a book to be new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to study a book. When you learn
a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of
book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your review, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, in
addition to soon. The Drug Lord: A True Story: The Life and Death of a Mexican Kingpin will give you new
experience in reading a book.

Doris Rice:

You could spend your free time to read this book this guide. This Drug Lord: A True Story: The Life and
Death of a Mexican Kingpin is simple bringing you can read it in the park your car, in the beach, train and
soon. If you did not possess much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make
you quicker to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that
you will get when you buy this book.

Ronda Powers:

Many people spending their period by playing outside along with friends, fun activity along with family or
just watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by looking at a book.
Ugh, think reading a book will surely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Drug Lord: A True Story: The
Life and Death of a Mexican Kingpin which is getting the e-book version. So , why not try out this book?
Let's observe.
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