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Sutra srca opisuje iskustvo oslobodjenja bodisatve saosecanja, Avalokitesvare, sto je rezultat uvida koji je
stekao boraveci u stanju duboke meditacije tokom kojeg je probudio sposobnost pradjne (mudrosti). Uvid se
odnosi na svest o fundamentalnoj praznini svih pojava, pet sastojaka ljudskog postojanja (skandi): oblika
(rupa), osecanja (vedana), htenja (volja, samskara, sankara), opazanja (samdjna) i svesti ili svesnosti
(vidjnana). Pun naziv ove sutre je "Srce Velike pradjna sutre" ili "Srce velike sutre stvarne mudrosti". Na
sanskritu zove se "Maha-pradjna-paramita-hridaja-sutra". Ona je srz (srce) mnogo duze sutre koja se sastoji
od 600 tomova, a napisana je pod nazivom "Maha-pradjna-paramita-sutra" (Velika sutra stvarne mudrosti).
Kao takva, poznata je u mahajana budizmu. Njen sanskritski naslov, "Pradjnaparamitardaja", doslovno znaci
"Srce savrsenstva razumevanja". "Sutra Srca" se cesto navodi kao najpoznatiji i najpopularniji budisticki
spis. Tekst sutre je veoma kratak, a za njega se generalno veruje da je budisticki apokrif napisan u Kini
upotrebom delova prevedene starije Mahapradjnaparamita sutre. Knjiga Slobodana Maldinija daje prvi put
celoviti prepev Sutre srca na srpskom jeziku, sa objasnjenjima pojmova, opisom porekla sutre i ranih
prepeva, analizira sadrzaj sutre i kritickim objasnjenjem i interpretacijom teksta sutre.
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From reader reviews:

Victoria Owen:

Book is actually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can understand everything you want by
a e-book. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important factor to bring us around the world.
Beside that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A book Sutra srca (Serbian Edition) will make you
to always be smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can know about almost everything.
But some of you think that open or reading a book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they can be
thought like that? Have you in search of best book or appropriate book with you?

Regina Nichols:

What do you consider book? It is just for students since they're still students or the idea for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that query above. Every person has
diverse personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they
don't want do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Sutra srca (Serbian Edition). All
type of book can you see on many resources. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Jacqueline Thompson:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book mainly book entitled
Sutra srca (Serbian Edition) your mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in most aspect
that maybe unidentified for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging each and every word written
in a reserve then become one type conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get prior to. The
Sutra srca (Serbian Edition) giving you one more experience more than blown away your brain but also
giving you useful data for your better life in this era. So now let us present to you the relaxing pattern the
following is your body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning a.
Do you want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Ronald Ruggles:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Make
an effort to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't assess book by its handle may
doesn't work is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside
search likes. Maybe you answer can be Sutra srca (Serbian Edition) why because the wonderful cover that
make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content is definitely
fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.
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