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So you're going to Israel? Don't go without this guide.

A trip to the Holy Land is, for most, a once-in-a-lifetime opportunity. In this one-stop guide, two
professionals—Charles Dyer, a Bible scholar and veteran Holy Land tour guide, and Greg Hatteberg,
graduate of the Institute of Holy Land Studies in Jerusalem—help you make the most of your trip.

With detailed maps and a full-color 16-page photo insert, this book walks you through five key biblical
regions: Israel, Egypt, Greece, Jordan, and Turkey, giving you a preview of what’s to come and helping you
make the most of every moment along the way.

Packing lists, jet lag tips, passport requirements, and a wealth of other practical information will assure you
that have everything you need, while a four-week prayer guide and Bible study prepare you for the spiritual
journey you are about to take.

The Christian Traveler’s Guide to the Holy Land traces the biblical events of over ninety of the most visited
sites and will ensure that your trip is an exciting, spiritually satisfying, and unforgettable experience.

This revised edition features newly excavated sites, up-to-date photos and maps, and relevant advice
for preparing for and preserving your trip.
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From reader reviews:

Nathan Barnes:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a move,
shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book eligible The Christian Traveler's
Guide to the Holy Land? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time
together with your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or
you have some other opinion?

Michael Burr:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you want
something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy
particular person? If you don't have spare time to do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And
you have time? What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. They must answer that question
simply because just their can do which. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is
proper. Because start from on guardería until university need this particular The Christian Traveler's Guide to
the Holy Land to read.

Lori Suda:

The book untitled The Christian Traveler's Guide to the Holy Land contain a lot of information on the item.
The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy way. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do
definitely not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was written by famous author. The author will bring
you in the new time of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can keep reading your
smart phone, or model, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-
book, you can available their official web-site and order it. Have a nice learn.

Donald Spada:

In this particular era which is the greater person or who has ability in doing something more are more
precious than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What
you need to do is just spending your time not much but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. On the
list of books in the top listing in your reading list is usually The Christian Traveler's Guide to the Holy Land.
This book and that is qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in growing to be precious person. By
looking up and review this guide you can get many advantages.
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