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In 2001, George W. Bush created the White House Office of Faith-Based and Community Initiatives. The
driving force behind the policy was to create a “level playing field” where faith-based organizations could
compete on an equal footing with secular organizations for government funding of social aid programs.
Given, on the one hand, the continuation of faith-based policy under Barack Obama and, on the other, the
continued support by the vast majority of the American people for some form of such policy, the need has
emerged to clearly understand what this policy is and the issues that it raises. Why? First, because the policy
reveals new paradigms that explode traditional political and religious designations such as
conservative–liberal or evangelical–progressive. Secondly, it is a policy which is setting precedents that with
time will only become more entrenched in the institutional fabric of American government and the values of
the culture. Finally, it does not seem to be a policy that is likely to just go away. And if it won’t go away,
then, how should responsible policy be conducted?

While John Chandler's Faith-Based Policy: A Litmus Test for Understanding Contemporary
Americaresponds to this need to understand, it also acknowledges that there is already a substantial amount
of documentation available, which, taken together, provides a comprehensive, though sometimes biased,
picture of faith-based policy. This book contributes a relatively brief, impartial analysis that draws on and
synthesizes the available information. More specifically, in order to dissipate the confusion surrounding the
perceptions that many have had concerning the intention and meaning of the policy, this book provides
insight into: 1) the theological visions of the faith-based actors behind the policy; 2) how these actors have
tried to apply these visions as the program has evolved in the 2000s; 3) the divisiveness and debate that has
characterized the faith-based experiment, and; 4) how all of the above may be held up for contemplation by
the reader as a mirror of developing American culture.
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From reader reviews:

Elizabeth Frizzell:

The book Faith-Based Policy: A Litmus Test for Understanding Contemporary America give you a sense of
feeling enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can to
become your best friend when you getting tension or having big problem with your subject. If you can make
examining a book Faith-Based Policy: A Litmus Test for Understanding Contemporary America to become
your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about a number of
or all subjects. You can know everything if you like open and read a book Faith-Based Policy: A Litmus Test
for Understanding Contemporary America. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science e-book or
encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about this book?

Ruby Mejia:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the name Faith-Based Policy:
A Litmus Test for Understanding Contemporary America suitable to you? The book was written by
renowned writer in this era. The actual book untitled Faith-Based Policy: A Litmus Test for Understanding
Contemporary Americais the main one of several books in which everyone read now. This kind of book was
inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this book you will enter the new dimensions that you
ever know before. The author explained their idea in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to be
aware of the core of this book. This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. To help
you see the represented of the world in this particular book.

Athena Thornton:

A lot of e-book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by world wide web on social
media. You can choose the best book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by simply searching
from it. It is referred to as of book Faith-Based Policy: A Litmus Test for Understanding Contemporary
America. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it may add your
knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring
you from one place to other place.

Jerri Jackson:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is created or printed or highlighted from each source that will filled update of
news. With this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for you. From media
social including newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
seeking the Faith-Based Policy: A Litmus Test for Understanding Contemporary America when you
necessary it?
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