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Robert M. Young's critically acclaimed 110-minute film Alambrista (1977) depicts the harsh realities of
Mexican life on both sides of the border. Following the birth of his first child, a young Mexican slips across
the border into the United States in search of the American dream for himself and his family. He finds
heartbreak, exploitation, and disappointment, but also friendship, affection, and help along the way.

When first released, Alambrista received critical praise and a number of awards, including a Camera d'Or at
the Cannes Film Festival. For the University of New Mexico Press release, a distinguished group of scholars
has packaged a new director's cut of the film with a book of essays devoted to immigration and the U.S.-
Mexican borderlands. These scholars include Albert Camarillo, Richard Griswold del Castillo, Daniel
Groody, Teresa Carrillo, Howie Movshovitz, Bill Ong Hing, José Cuellar, Cordelia Candelaria, and the
editors.

The director's cut includes new scenes, an improved sound track with a totally new musical score by "Dr.
Loco and Los Tiburones del Norte," English subtitles, and interviews with the director and other participants.
Also included with the book and DVD is an enhanced CD of the sound track.
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From reader reviews:

Allen Reilley:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As it is known to
us that book is very important usually. The book Alambrista and the U.S.-Mexico Border: Film, Music, and
Stories of Undocumented Immigrants seemed to be making you to know about other information and of
course you can take more information. It doesn't matter what advantages for you. The guide Alambrista and
the U.S.-Mexico Border: Film, Music, and Stories of Undocumented Immigrants is not only giving you more
new information but also to become your friend when you truly feel bored. You can spend your own
personal spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship using the book Alambrista and the U.S.-
Mexico Border: Film, Music, and Stories of Undocumented Immigrants. You never really feel lose out for
everything when you read some books.

Anna Humphrey:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the subject Alambrista and
the U.S.-Mexico Border: Film, Music, and Stories of Undocumented Immigrants suitable to you? The actual
book was written by popular writer in this era. Often the book untitled Alambrista and the U.S.-Mexico
Border: Film, Music, and Stories of Undocumented Immigrantsis the main of several books in which
everyone read now. This particular book was inspired many people in the world. When you read this book
you will enter the new dimension that you ever know prior to. The author explained their idea in the simple
way, and so all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this reserve. This book will give you a lots of
information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world on this book.

Candy Smith:

You can get this Alambrista and the U.S.-Mexico Border: Film, Music, and Stories of Undocumented
Immigrants by check out the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve
difficulty if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by simply
written or printed but in addition can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era like now, you
just looking by your local mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your own
ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your
knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose appropriate ways for you.

Lynn Bailey:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is composed or printed or outlined from each source in which filled update of
news. Within this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From
media social like newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or



just in search of the Alambrista and the U.S.-Mexico Border: Film, Music, and Stories of Undocumented
Immigrants when you desired it?
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