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From Book 1: A Vision of Fire is the explosive first novel from iconic X-Files star Gillian Anderson and
New York Times bestselling author Jeff Rovin: “Fans of Douglas Preston and Lincoln Child will find a lot to
like” (Publishers Weekly).

Renowned child psychologist Caitlin O’Hara is a single mom trying to juggle her job, her son, and a
lackluster dating life. Her world is suddenly upturned when Maanik, the daughter of India’s ambassador to
the United Nations starts speaking in tongues and having violent visions. Maanik’s parents are sure that her
fits have something to do with the recent assassination attempt on her father—a shooting that has escalated
nuclear tensions between India and Pakistan to dangerous levels—but when children start having similar
outbursts around the world, Caitlin begins to think that there’s a stranger force at work.

In Haiti, a student claws at her throat, drowning on dry land. In Iran, a boy suddenly and inexplicably bursts
into flame. On the Pakistan border, a young man feels a burning in his chest and, against his will, opens fire
on Indian troops. With Asia on the cusp of nuclear war, Caitlin must race across the globe and uncover the
supernatural links between these seemingly unrelated cases in order to save her patient—and perhaps the
world.

The first in a series, A Vision of Fire is a pulse-pounding thriller that will leave you gasping for more.
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From reader reviews:

Valerie Little:

What do you about book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you really
need something to explain what your own problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy individual?
If you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have
time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They have to answer that question due to
the fact just their can do that will. It said that about guide. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is correct.
Because start from on kindergarten until university need this Earthend Saga (2 Book Series) to read.

Harold Singleton:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
so. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a publication you will get new information simply because book is one of a
number of ways to share the information or even their idea. Second, looking at a book will make a person
more imaginative. When you reading a book especially hype book the author will bring someone to imagine
the story how the personas do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other people. When you
read this Earthend Saga (2 Book Series), you may tells your family, friends and also soon about yours
publication. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a guide.

Joan Beverly:

You can obtain this Earthend Saga (2 Book Series) by look at the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or
reviewing it might to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this book are
various. Not only by written or printed but can you enjoy this book simply by e-book. In the modern era such
as now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose
your personal ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange you to
ultimately make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose proper ways for you.

Tyler Cote:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is composed or printed or outlined from each source this filled update of news. In
this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media social
including newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just in
search of the Earthend Saga (2 Book Series) when you necessary it?
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