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"From the first to the last page, this book is so full of information that as a person working in the world of
spinal cord injury, I found myself in an unfamiliar situation. Never had I read a book related to my
profession that I didnít have trouble putting down. Iím not saying that such books are boring by any means;
however, they are not the captivating fictional reads that keep people up late on work nights thinking 'just
one more chapter.' Essentials of Spinal Cord Medicine was that type of book for me!... Overall, I thought this
book was nothing short of fantastic... it was so full of information that makes me feel more confident as a
technologist, and more compassionate as a human. I would highly recommend this for any practitioner
working in the field where they may encounter a person with spinal cord injury." -- Donna Jacobs, R. EEG
T., CNIM, The Neurodiagnostic Journal

This compact text is a practical, concise guide for clinicians involved in the care of patients with spinal cord
injuries and disorders. It covers a comprehensive and diverse list of topics encompassing the principles and
practice of spinal cord injury care, including basic science fundamentals, traumatic spinal cord injury, non-
traumatic myelopathies, physical function and rehabilitation, medical consequences and complications of
spinal cord injury, psychosocial and quality of life issues, and systems-based practice.

Chapters are consistently formatted for ease of use and are organized under the broad headings of general
principles, clinical considerations, and knowledge gaps and emerging concepts, and conclude with a curated
list of suggested readings. Within these categories, specifics on underlying pathophysiology and etiology,
assessment (examination, testing, differential diagnosis, prognosis, and risk factors) and management (non-
pharmacological, medications, surgical procedures, follow-up and monitoring, primary and secondary
prevention, and complications), and recent clinical advances and promising research are easily accessed. The
book also addresses such quality of life issues as psychological adaptation, sexuality and fertility, vocational
training, driving, and exercise, and includes information about systems of care and patient safety as well as
ethical considerations. The guide is peppered with useful tables that highlight and reinforce key material.
Additionally, ìPractice Pearlsî in selected chapters enhance the guide as a handy go-to reference for
clinicians and trainees in multiple disciplines who care for people with spinal cord injuries and disorders.

Key Features:

A concise, practical manual designed for rapid access to key information on a broad range of topics integral●

to the practice of spinal cord medicine
Covers both traumatic spinal cord injury and non-traumatic disorders and their evaluation, management,●

medical complications, functional rehabilitation, and quality of life concerns
Packed with useful tables to highlight and reinforce key material●

Formatted consistently with short, reader-friendly paragraphs and clarifying sub-titles●
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From reader reviews:

Gary Kruse:

This Essentials of Spinal Cord Medicine book is just not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in
your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is definitely information inside this book incredible
fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get. This specific
Essentials of Spinal Cord Medicine without we know teach the one who examining it become critical in
considering and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry Essentials of Spinal Cord Medicine can bring whenever
you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it within your
lovely laptop even mobile phone. This Essentials of Spinal Cord Medicine having very good arrangement in
word and layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Megan Fairbanks:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of
new facts. When you read a e-book you will get new information since book is one of several ways to share
the information or maybe their idea. Second, reading a book will make anyone more imaginative. When you
looking at a book especially fictional works book the author will bring that you imagine the story how the
characters do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other people. When you read this
Essentials of Spinal Cord Medicine, it is possible to tells your family, friends along with soon about yours
reserve. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a e-book.

Olive Wilson:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV,
or even playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity here is look different you can
read the book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent all day every
day to reading a guide. The book Essentials of Spinal Cord Medicine it is quite good to read. There are a lot
of people who recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have
enough space to develop this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book
through your smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book has high quality.

Randy Garrison:

It is possible to spend your free time to read this book this e-book. This Essentials of Spinal Cord Medicine
is simple bringing you can read it in the area, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not have much
space to bring the printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can
save typically the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when
one buys this book.
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