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Urdu translaion in verse of the selected Persian odes of Amir Khusro Khusro was born in India in 1252 AD
and died 73 years later. His maternal grandfather was the prime minister of India and throughout his life
Khusro remained the favorite of kings and princes. Afluent and jovial, Khusro was a poet-musician of
magical qualities. He was the inventer of Urdu language which is now spoken by hundred of million of
people today. He invented many famous ragas and musical instruments. He wrote poetry in both his new
language, Urdu, as well as in Persian in which he wrote thousands of odes. Khusro's interpretation of Love's
musings is frevolous, fanciful and lovely proving that love and poetry walk hand in hand - always have and
always will. In this book Khalid Hameed Shaida has presented 444 of Khusro Persian odes in Urdu.
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From reader reviews:

Peggy Ross:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children till adult are different content. To be sure that book
is very important for all of us. The book Odes Of Khusro - Persian To Urdu Translation (Urdu Edition)
seemed to be making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It is
extremely advantages for you. The guide Odes Of Khusro - Persian To Urdu Translation (Urdu Edition) is
not only giving you a lot more new information but also for being your friend when you truly feel bored.
You can spend your current spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship with all the book
Odes Of Khusro - Persian To Urdu Translation (Urdu Edition). You never feel lose out for everything in the
event you read some books.

Neil Myers:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and
notice by means of surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated that for a
while is reading. That's why, by reading a e-book your ability to survive increase then having chance to
endure than other is high. For you personally who want to start reading the book, we give you this Odes Of
Khusro - Persian To Urdu Translation (Urdu Edition) book as nice and daily reading e-book. Why, because
this book is greater than just a book.

Rodney Hussey:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray anyone, why because this Odes Of Khusro - Persian To Urdu
Translation (Urdu Edition) guide written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book
which can be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written with good manner for you, still
dripping wet every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still question
Odes Of Khusro - Persian To Urdu Translation (Urdu Edition) as good book not only by the cover but also
by the content. This is one reserve that can break don't evaluate book by its cover, so do you still needing
another sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already alerted you so why
you have to listening to an additional sixth sense.

Eric Kyler:

Reading a book to become new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to study a book. When you
study a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what types of
book that you have read. If you need to get information about your analysis, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, along with soon. The Odes
Of Khusro - Persian To Urdu Translation (Urdu Edition) provide you with a new experience in examining a



book.
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